
   

AI-32946       4.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted By: Sylvia Sanchez, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

Presentation by the Hidalgo County Drainage Advisory Committee on recommendations.

BACKGROUND

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/21/2012 03:23 PM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Sylvia Sanchez Started On: 06/21/2012 02:33 PM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 



   

AI-32835       5.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted By: Sylvia Sanchez, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

Presentation and discussion by Hollis Rutledge & Associates on the recapturing of funds through federal

and state agencies and other sources.

BACKGROUND

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/14/2012 11:29 AM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Sylvia Sanchez Started On: 06/14/2012 11:03 AM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 



   

AI-32838       6.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted By: Jaime Salazar, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

A.) Requesting approval of the District's Liability-Property Re-rate exposure summary with Texas

Municipal League (TML) for General Liability, Errors and Omissions, Auto Liability, Physical Damage,

Property, Equipment Schedule and Workers Compensation.  

B.) Requesting approval of Supplemental Agreement No.1 for Geo-technical Engineering Services as it

relates to the Hidalgo County Drainage District No.1-Alamo Expwy Drain / Crossing Project.    

BACKGROUND

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/14/2012 02:47 PM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Jaime Salazar Started On: 06/14/2012 01:55 PM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 



   

AI-32876       7.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted By: Minerva Luna, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

A. Request approval of Payment Request to SER Construction Partners, LTD. for Final Payment and

Final Release of Retainage plus interest on DHS Segment 0-6BC Payment Request No. 23 (1.38 miles).

B. Request approval of Payment Request to SER Construction Partners, LTD. for Final Payment and

Final Release of Retainage plus interest on DHS Segment 0-7 Payment Request No. 24 (0.90 miles).

C. Request approval to process manual checks to SER Construction Partners, LTD. for the above

mentioned projects pending the approval of County Auditor and Department of Homeland Security

(DHS) and pending the electronic transfer of funds from the Department of Payment Management (DPM).

BACKGROUND

Attachments

DHS 0-6BC PR 23 Final

DHS 0-7 PR 24 Final

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/19/2012 10:33 AM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Minerva Luna Started On: 06/19/2012 09:00 AM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 
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Pro;ectNamll: 
ContrKtor: 

REQUEST FOR P ...YMENT 
DHS SEGMENT 0·68 & 0-6C (1 .38 MILES) 
SER CONSTRUCTION PARTNERS. L TO. 

Address: 3636 Pas.odona Blvd. 

~ 
Cltv/State/Zip: PUlidenl, Texis 77503 

REQUEST FOR FINAL P",YMENT NO. 23 

CONTltACT NO. _____p",ject Number: 4410-08 1.38 MIl£S 
WORI( THOu: _____Oatil : 6/13/2012 

PROGRESS BILLING WORKSHEET · NO. 1 

ROSBEl E. RAMOS. PRESIDENT ITEM UNIT TOTAL BID UNIT TOTAL NO. 
NO QU"'NTITY PRICE BID PRICE 

TEMP EROSION CONTROL (FILTER FABRIC FENCE) LF 
21 .... 25.31 

1 14600 $ 3.00 S 43800.00 B 35 
MOBILIZATION 2 LS I S 1 100000.00 $ 1 100000.00 
TEMP EROSION CONTROL CONST EXIT / ENTER) 3 EA 2 $ 2000.00 S 4000.00 

REMOVEISTOCKl'ILE EXIST EMBANKMENT 4 CY 11 .500 $ 10.00 $ 115.000.00 
21.... 25.31 
B 35 36A 

1.21 .... 23.2 

·RETAINI NG WALL (CAST·IN· PLACEXSTEM) 5 CY 5.260 S 600.00 S 3.156.000.00 5.31B.34.3 
6A,41 .42.4 

3 
1.21"'.25.2 

• RETAINING WALL (CAST·IN·PLACE) (FOOTING) 6 CY 6.715 S 550.00 S 3.693.250.00 7.31B.34.3 
6 .... 41.42.4 

3 
21.... 25.31 

RETAINING WALL (CAST·IN· PLACE)(KEY) 1 CY 938 S SOO.OO $ 469.000.00 B.34. 
414243 

TRENCH EXCAVATION PROTECTION 8 LF 7.300 $ 1.00 $ 1300.00 31B 36... 
TEMPORARY SPECIAL SHORING 9 SF 2700 $ 2.00 $ 5400.00 21 .... 31B 

CONSTRUCT GATE WELL STRUCTURE W/ SLUICE 
10 EA I S 120.000.00 S 120.000.00 

GATE, HATCH. LADDER'" APPURTENANCES. (9 n , 1011) 

PERFORATED UNDERDRAIN PIPE (6IN.XPVC) LF 
21....25.31 

11 7.300 S 17.00 $ 124 100.00 83441 

AGGREGATE DRAIN MATERIAL CY 
2.21 .... 25.3 

12 5877 S 60.00 $ 352620.00 183441 
METAL BE,\M GUARD FENCE 13 LF 6165 $ 20.00 $ 123300.00 525 
PREPAK,\TION RIGHT Of WAY 14 STA 73 $ 10.00 $ 130.00 
REMOVE EXIST. CONCRETE CURB 61N) 15 LF 5072 $ 1.00 $ 5072.00 41 
REMOVED EXIST ASPHALT 16 SY 5057 S 1.00 S 35399.00 
REMOVE EXIST STRUCTURES 17 EA I _$ 3000.00 $ 3000.00 

21 ....25.30. 
EMBANKMENT CY 318.34.35. 

18 81640 S 20.00 S 1 632800.00 36....41 
EMBANKME~'T BORROW SITE 19 CY 7S 000 $ 15.00 $ 1 125000.00 30 

CONe. RI P RAP CL-B (SLOPE PROTECTION) CY 19.... 21,...2 
20 2000 _$ 240.00 $ 480000.00 531836A 

CONC. PAD 4 FT X 4 FT 21 EA 14 $ 400.00 $ 5600.00 
HOT MIX AS PHALT 21N 22 S\' 4958 $ 17.00 $ 84286.00 4245 
PRIME OIL MC·30 23 GAL 992 $ 7.00 $ 6944.00 4245 
PAVEMEl\T MARKING 24 LS I S 6000.00 $ 6000.00 4245 
FURNISHING & PLACING TOPSOIL (SALVAGED 

STA
MATERIAL 25 20 J 1 500.00 $ 30000.00 21,.. 31B 

FURNISHI NG &. PLACiNG TOPSOIL (NEW) STA 21 ....25,31 
26 S3 $ 1100.00 $ 90100.00 B 

FLEXBASE (SALVAGED MATERlAL)(CALICHE)(TY D GR 
CY 6)(6 IN) 27 1082 $ 9.00 S 9738.00 21A..31B 

FLEXBASE (NEW) (CALICHE) (TY 0 GR 6)(61/\) cv 18B.21 .... 2 
28 4040 $ 30.00 $ 121 200.00 5318 

PROP. CONe. CURB 61N) 29 LF 4850 $ 6.00 $ 29100.00 47 

HYDRO MULCH SY 21 .... 25.31 
30 52723 S 0.80 $ 42118.40 B 35 36A 

REINF. CONC. PIPE 72 IN CL V) 31 LF 310 $ 350.00 $ 108500.00 42 
CONe. HEADWALL 72 IN) 32 EA 2 S 12000.00 $ 24000.00 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA & 

EA
INSTALL PER PLANS 5 FT.) 33 1079 S 59.00 ..l 63661.00 10A 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA & 

EA
INSTALL PER PLANS 6 FT. 34 442 S 62.00 $ 27404.00 10... 
BOLL\RD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA '" 

EA
INSTALL PER PLANS 7 FT. 35 196 $ 74.00 $ 14504.00 10....17... 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA '" 

EA 
INSTALL PER PLANS 8 n. 36 687 $ 87.00 S 59769.00 1DA 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA '" 

EAINSTALL PER PLANS 9 FT.) 37 1128 $ 100.00 $ 112800.00 10 ... 

QTY. 
+/ . 

CH... NGE ORDERS 
UNIT VARIANCE 

PRICE AMOUNT 
UNITQTY. 

COMPLETE 
+ / . +/. PRIOR INVOICES 

15436.00 S 3.00 S 2 S08.OO 11....01 
$ ".0 
S Z.OO 

13.839.00 S 10.00 S 23.390.00 13.1&00 

5.515.59 $ 599.660536769 $ 151 .481 .66 S,IfUI 

1.290.30 $ 574.7289096 $ 496.696.11 7.2IIU' 

992.61 $ 497.693866038 $ 25.045.77 I82A7 

1300.00 S 1.00 $ 7.300.00 
6281 .00 $ 2.00 $ 7182.00 uaua 

$ t. 

7820.00 S 17.0091531969 $ 8916.21 7ea.00 

1129.11 S 59.9468608019 $ .1284 933.40 '-12*.U 
389.00 $ 20.00 $ 115520.00 JII.OO 

$ 1100 
7288.00 $ 1.00 $ 2216.00 7.21&00 

S 5.057.00 
..l 1.00 

162587.50 S 19.6413008380 $ 1 560 630.00 1112.5IUII 
6667.00 S 15.00 $ 1 024995.00 a.1I7.OD 

585.87 $ 240.00 .S 1339391.20 IIU7 
$ 14.00 

4958.00 S 17.00 $ 1fJ­992.00 $ 7.00 $ 
1.00 $ 6000.00 S 

23.00 $ 1500.00 $ 4500.00 2100 

58.00 $ 1 700.00 S 8 SOO.OO IlI.DO 

1114.00 S 9.00 S 288.00 1. tt4.DQ 

5272.00 $ 30.00 $ 36960.00 U72.DO 
7066.00 S 6.00 $ 13296.00 7._DG 

59032.00 $ 0.80 $ 5047.20 II.DS2.DD 
260.00 $ 350.00 $ 17 500.00 ~ 

S 2.DD 

0.00 S 59.00 S 63661 .001 D.DD 

0.00 $ 62.00 i _i27404.00 a.ao 

432.00 $ 34.10 $ 227.20 d2.111 

695.00 S 81.00 $ 696.00 I1115.DD 

1147.00 $ 100.00 S 1900.00 , t.n.DO 

UNIT QTY. UNITQTY. AMOU~ 
COMPLETE COMPLETE PRl()f; 

THIS PERIOD TO D ... TE INVOICI 

UII 15436.00 
4 

D.OO 1.00 110 
DJlO 2.00o. 13.839.00 13 

O.DO 5.515.59 3 .30 

0.00 7.290.30 4.11t 

O.DD 992.61 49­

D.GO 1300.00 
0.00 6281 .00 1: 

0.00 1.00 1ll 

0.00 7820.00 
13: 

D.OO 1129.11 
6 

8.00 389.00 
D.OO 73.00 
8.00 7288.00 
0.00 5057.00 3! 
8.00 1.00 

0.00 162587.50 319 
a.oo 6667.00 101 

D.DD 585.87 141 

UO 14.00 
O-DD 4958.00 So 
0.00 992.00 
~.OO 1.00 

UL 23.00 3, 

D.DO 58.00 91 

aM 1114.00 11 

D.DD 5272.00 151 
O,DD 7066.00 4 

0.00 59032.00 4 

D.DO 260.00 9 
a.ao 2.00 2' 

11.00 0.00 

D •• 0 .00 

D.DD 432.00 " 
a.oo 695.00 6i 

D.DD 1147.00 11! 



' .. 

BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA & 
lOA,17A,2 

EA lA,31B,35
INSTALL PER PLANS) (10FT.) 38 2961 5 102.00 5 302022.00 36A 2849.00 5 102.00 5 111424.00 ' 2.848.00 0.00 2849.00 2! 
BOLLARD (TRANSP,ORT FROM STAGING AREA & EA 

5 110.00 5 5 5 .77.00 0.00INSTALL PER PLANS 12FT. 39 456 50 160.00 lOA 4n.00 110.00 2310.00 477.00 ! 

BOLLARD ITRA'ISPORT FROM STAGING AREA & EA 10A.17A,2 
INSTALL PER PLANS) (20FT.) lA,25.34,3 

40 S54 5 276.00 _$ 152904.00 5 36A 41 1221.00 $ 232.373484373 $ 130824.00 t.221.00 1.00 1 221.00 28 
BOLL,\RD (SUPPLY, CUT & WELD ANGLE IRON LF lOA, 17A,2 
SUPORTS 41'1 X 4 IN X 1/41N 8 FT) 41 8201 $ 24.00 $ 196968.00 lA,2534 7749.00 5 24.00 $ (10992.00 1.7411.DO 0.00 7749.00 18 
SIGN REMOVE & REPLACE 42 EA 5 5 240.00 S 1 200.00 S 5.00 0.00 5.00 
SIGN REMOVE & RELOCATE) 43 EA 22 S 360.00 S 7920.00 $ lOO OJIII 22.00 
FLAP GATES W I WALL PIPE & TEE (6 IN. 44 EA 14 S 2000.00 S 28000.00 $ 1.4.00 OJlO 14.00 2 
CAT OPENING 45 EA 2 ~ 500.00 S 1 000.00 21A,2542 0.00 $ 500.00 $ 1 000.00 0.00 DJlCL 0.00 
ANTI CLIMBING FENCE 46 EA 2 5 10000.00 5 20000.00 21A 25 35 7.00 S 10000.00 S 50 000.00 T.OO 0.00 7.00 7 
48" STAND PIPE TO BE CAPPED IN PLACE 47 EA I S 6000.00 5 6000.00 S 1.00 0,111\ 1.00 

2, 

SHEET WALL DRAIN MATERIAL SF 
21A,25,31 

B,34, 
48 0 S S 41 69541.00 S 3.2628594642 $ 226902.51 ••541.00 0.00 69541.00 . 22 

ADVANCE FEE TO AEP 49 LS 0 S 5 7A 1.00 S 16505.80 5 16505.80 1.00 0.00 1.00 " REMOVE CONCRETE HEADWALL 51 EA 0 S S 15 1.00 S 1 250.00 5 1250.00 1.00 0.00 1.00 
CONSTRUCT CONCRETE HEADWALL 52 EA 0 $. 5 15 1.00 S 5500.00 $ 5500.00 1,IXL D.DO 1.00 1 
PRf...CAST 36" 45 DEGREE BEND 53 EA 0 S $ 15 1.00 $ 1 800.00 S 1800.00 1.00 0.00 1.00 
36" RCP CLASS V 54 LF 0 $ $ 15 38.00 S 150.00 $ 5700.00 ''-~O 0.00 38.00 , 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA & 

EAFABRICATE 10') 58 0 .S $ 17A 120.00 $ 62.10 $ 7452.00 120.00 0.00 120.00 
STONE RIP RAP 24" THICK TY R DRY 59 CY 0 $ $ 19A 3956.00 S 90.00 S 356040.00 use.00 0,00 3956.00 35­
WELD AN ADDITIONAL 10' BOLLARD (TRANSPORT & 

EA
WEI.D) 60 0 S $ 22 33A 40.00 S 776.38 S 31 055.20 40JlD 0.00 40.00 3' 

FLEXBASE (NEW) (CALICHE) (TY D GR 6)(8 IN) (RAMP) CY 
21A,25,31 

61 0 S $ B 35 36A 476.00 S 30.00 S 14280.00 471.00 0.00 476.00 1­

CONCRETE HEADER LF 
21A,25,35, 

62 0 $ $ 36A 184.00 $ 140.79 $ 25905.36 lkDD 0.00 164.00 2: 
TEMPORARV CHAIN LINK FENCE 10 FT 63 LF 0 $ S 21A 79.00 S 58.00 $ 4582.00 7!L00 0..00 79.00 -CONCRETE BOLLARD FOUNDATION] 64 CY 0 $ S 2829 217.00 $ 486.68 $ 105609.56 217.00 0.00 217.00 10~ 

DOUBLE SWING GATE 24 FT 65 EA 0 $ $ 252942 0.00 S 2 160.00 S 0.00 0.00 0.00 
REMovE CHAI,N LINK FENCE 66 LS 0 S S 25 1.00 S 200.00 5 200.00 1.00 0.00 1.00 
REMOVE EXISTING CURB AND GtrITER 67 LF 0 S $ 25 50.00 S 5.00 S 250.00 5Il.00 0.00 50.00 
DlJCTILE IRON PIPE EXTENSION 6 IN 68 LF 0 ~ _$ 25 23.00 $ 40.00 S 920.00 2100 0.00 23.00 
OWN LINK FENCE 10 IT 69 LF 0 $ $ 2542 0.00 $ 40.00 $ G..Of 0..00. 0.00 
HEADWALL FOR FLAP GATES 70 LS 0 $ $ 2535 2.00 $ 600.00 $ 1 200.00 2.00 0.00 2.00 1 
REMOVE AND RESET FLAP GATE 71 EA 0 $ S 2535 2.00 $ 300.00 $ 600.00 2.00 0.00 2.00 
REMOVE & RECONSTRUCT OF RETAINING WALL CAP 
(3 IT CAP) (SALVAGED EXISTING VERTICAL AND LF 
HORIWNTAL REINFORCING STEEL) 72 0 $ $ 25 150.00 S 127.00 $ 19050.00 tsO.OO o..ao 150.00 11 
PEDESTRLAN SAFETY FENCE 73 LF 0 $ $ 2638 28323.00 $ 16.11 $ 456283.53 21,323.00 0.00 28323.00 451 
REMOVE EXIST. PIPE 60 IN) 74 EA 0 $ S 31B 1.00 S 3885.05 S 3885.05 1.00 0.00 1.00 : 
REMOVE EXIST. HEADWALL 60 IN 75 EA 0 l. $ 31B 2.00 $ 2715.41 $ 5430.82 _2.00 .0.00 2.00 1 
REMOVE / SALVAGED(EXIST SL UICE GATE & 

EAAPPURTENANCES) (181'1) (RCP) 76 0 S $ 31B 1.00 $ 563.07 $ 563.07 1.00 0.00 1.00 
REI 'IF. CONe. BOX 5 IT X S IT 77 LF 0 $ S 31B 36A 621.00 S 263.35 $ 163540.35 621.00 0.00 621.00 16, 
CANAL BYPASS SO CFS 78 LS 0 S S 31B 1.00 S 188174.13 S 188174.13 1 .00 0.00 1.00 181 

CONe. HEADWALL (5 IT X 5 IT RCB) (STRAIGHT WING) 
79 

EA 
0 $ $ 3536A 3.00 S 7002.00 $ 21 006.00 3.00 0 ,00 3.00 21 

CONe. HEADWALL 5 IT X 5 IT RCB SPECIAL 80 CY 0 $ S 3536A 45.00 $ 439.888 $ 19794.96 45.00 0.00 45.00 1! 
CONSTRUCT GATE WELL STRUCTlJRE WI SLUI CE 

EA
GATE GRATE & LADDER 1& IT X 6 IT) 81 0 $ S 31B 36A 3.00 S 117 803.98 $ 353411.94 3.00 0.00 3.00 35, 
REMOVE EXIST PIPE(24IN 82 EA 0 $ .S. 31B 1.00 $ 1971.17 ~ 1971.17 '.00 . 0.00 1.00 1 
ANTI-CUMBING FENCE PANEL OWNER FURNISHED 83 LS 0 $ $ 33A 1.00 S 3185.01 $ 3185.01 1.00 0.00 1.00 , 
REINF CONC PIPE 24 IN CL V 89 LF 0 $ $ 31B 36A 0.00 $ 155.12 $ 0.00 0.00 0.00 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA & 

EA
INSTALL PER PLANS)(/4IT 90 0 $ S 31B 35 0.00 S 130.00 .1 0.00 0.00 0.00 
GENERA TOR RENTAL COSTS 91 LS 0 . $. .i. 37 1.00 .$ 55248.00 1. 55248.00 t.OO 0.00 1.00 51 
4'-6" EXTENSION 92 CY 0 $ $ 4447 647.00 $ 419.00 $ 271 093.00 "'1.00 0.00 647.00 271 
2'-8" EXTENSION 93 CY 0 $ $ 44 47 77.00 $ 419.00 $ 32263.00 77.0 0.00 77.00 3. 
4'·~" EXTENSION 94 CY 0 $ $ 4447 75.00 $ 419.00 $ 31 425.00 11..01 0.00 75.00 31 
CUT AND SALVAGE EXISTING BOLLARDS 95 EA 0 $ S 44 4577.00 $ 20.00 S 91 540.00 4.m . 0.00 4577.00 91 
REGRADE EXISTING CALICHE 96 SY 0 S S 44 47 5000.00 5 8.00 S 40000.00 5000. 0.00 5000.00 4( 
2" LlGlITiNG CONDlJIT (WISTUB lJPS 97 LF 0 $ ~ 4447 2401.00 $ 9.77 _l. 23457.77 2.0C81 . 0.00 2401.00 2, 
AEP COST LIGHT POLE WIRING & LIGHT FIXTURES 98 LS 0 $ $ 44 47 1.00 $ 14703.64 $ 14703.64 1.00 0.00 1.00 1~ 

REMOBILIZA TlON 99 LS 0 $ $ 44 1.00 S 36000.00 S 36000.00 1.00 0.00 1.00 31 
CHAlNLlNK FENCE 9 GAGEXS') 100 LS 0 $ $ 46 1.00 $ 74245.16 $ 74245.16 1.00 0.00 1.00 7~ 

LIGHT TOWER RENTAL 101 LS 0 $ $ 48 1.00 $ 6120.42 S 6120.42 0.00 t ,OO 1.00 
ENGINEj:RlNG INSPECTION N/A DAY 0 $ S 36A 70.00 $ 90.30 $ 8,321.00 10.00 0.00 70.00 ___I 

M:\1540\4410-08 DHS SeK 0-6BC\Pay Requests\Payment Request No. 23\Payment Request No. 23 - Seg O-SSC - 020312 - blowup 2 o( 3 




ORIGINAl CONTRACT AMOUNT: 14,197,729.40 

NET CHANGES BY CHANGE ORDER(S) 3,360,239.12 

TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE Is 17,557,968.521 _I I ~. I -_=.l - 1- _ . ~s 17,5'
" 

Estimated % Project Completion to Date: 100.00'% LESS RETAINAGE @ 10% 
RELEASED RETAINAGE PR .1 I 

CREDIT FOR ENGINEERING INSPECTION 
RELEASED RETAINAGE PR #19 

RELEASE OF REMAINING RET AINAGE TO D~ 

LESS Pre ....ious Requests for Payments 
DEFECTIVE WORK CO NO. 39 
DEFECTIVE WORK CO NO. 40 

TOTAl. AMOUNT DUE THIS REQUEST 

M:\lS40\4410'()8 DHS Seg Q-6BC\ Pay Requesls\Payment Request No. 23\ Payment Request No. 23 - Seg O-GBe - 020 312 - blowup 30f :3 

http:3,360,239.12
http:14,197,729.40
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REQUEST FOR PAYMENT 
proJm Nam~: DHS SEGMENT 0·7 (0.9 MILES) 

Contractor: SER CONSTRUCTION PARTNERS, LTD. 

Addre~: 3636 P'SlcIon. Blvd. 
Ctty/State/Zlp: Pasadena. TnAS nSOJ .~ 

c: - --- - REQUEST FOR FINAL PAYMENT NO. 24 J 

Proiect Number: 4410-020.9 MILES C~NO. ~1~1 

Dat~: 6/13/2012 WORK THRU: 1l/26{ll · 5/31/12 

PROGRESS BILLING WORKSHEET· NO. 1 

CHANGE ORDERS 

ROSBEL E. RAMOS, PRESIDENT ITEM UNIT TOTAL BID UNIT TOTAl NO. QTY. UNIT VARIANCE UNIT QTY. UNITQTY. UNITQTY. AMOUNT AMOUNT 
NO QUANTITY PRICE BID PRICE +/. PRICE AMOUNT COMPLETE COMPLETE COMPLETE PRIOR COMPLETE T 

+/. +/. PRIOR INVOICES THIS PERIOD TO DATE INVOICES DATE 
TEMP ERQ§ION CONTROL FI LTER FABRI FENCE 1 LF 10.000 5 2.00 5 20000.00 28 10527.00 5 2.00 5 1 054.00 10.577,00 0.00 10577.00 5 21054.00 5 21 OS 
TEMP EROSION C(LNTROL CONST EXIT/EI\,R 2 EA 2 .5 2000.00 5 4000.00 28 3.00 5 2000.00 5 2000.00 l .OO D.DO 3.00 S 6.000.00 5 600 
REMOVE I STOCKPILE (EXIST FLEX BASE) 
CALICHE 4-10 IN. 3 CY 750 S 15.00 5 11 250.00 5 7.50.00 D.DO 750.00 $ 11 250.00 $ 112S 
REMOVE! STOCKPLI E EXIST TOPSOIL 4-6 IN! 4 CY 2450 S 7.00 5 17 150.00 28 2734.00 5 7.00 5 1 988.00 2..734,00 O,DO 2734.00 5 19138.00 S 1913 
REMOVE/STOCKPILE EXIST EMBAl~KMENT) 5 CY 13438 S 7.00 . $ 94 066.00 5 11431.00 O.DO 13438.00 $ 94 066.00 S 94 06 

3,15, 
RETAINING WALL CAST·IN·PLACE STEM) 6 CY 4752 $ 600.00 $ 2851 200.00 2030 4267.00 $ 600.94 S 1286989.021 4.217-01 0.00 4267.00 S 2564210.98 S 2564 21 

5,17.2 
RETAINING WALL (CAST·IN·PLACE) (FOOTING) 7 CY 8,393 S 600.00 S 5035800.00 0 6952.88 5 728.83 S 31667.53 11.152." 0.00 6952.88 .5 5067 467.53 J 506746 
RETAINING WALL CAST.IN·PLACEXKEY 8 CY 2287 S 540.00 S 1 234 980.00 320 594.52 S 1659.75 S 248225.43 MHZ D,OO 594.52 S 986754.57 5 98675 

1,25,2 
METAL BEAM. GUARD FENCe 9 LF 4695 S 23.00 5 107985.00 8 450.00 5 23.00 S (97635.00 4SO.OD 0.00 450.00 5 10350.00 S 1035 
METAL BEAM GUARD FENCE 9A LF 0 5 $ 31A 112.50 $ 18.50 $ 2081 .25 0 .00 112.50 112.50 .l. 208 
PVC UNDERDRAIN PIPE 61Nl 10 LF 4650 S 15.00 S 69750.00 S 4.MO.DD O.DO 4650.00 S 69750.00 S 69 75 
AGGREGATE DRAIN MATERIAL 11 CY 5260 S 60.00 S 315600.00 4 665.04 S 60.0004059906 S 275697.33 • .IM 0.00 665.04 S 39902.67 S 3990 
PREPARATION RIGHT OF WAY 12 STA 48 S 10000.00 5 480000.00 5 41.00 0.00 48.00 S 460 000.00 ..!. 48000 

20,28, 
EMBANKMENT (NEW) 13 CY 39543 S 10.00 5 395430.00 3031A 45635.00 S 10.00 S 60 920.00 45.U5.DO O.DD 45635.00 S 456350.00 S 45635­

16,28, 
CONC. RI P RAP ClrB.J..SLOPE PROTECTION) 14 CY 550 S 400.00 S 220000.00 31A 573.00 S 400.00 S 9200.00 57100 0.00 573.00 5 229 200.00 S 22920 
CONe. BOLLARD 6 IN.) n 'p 2 15 EA 6 5 500.00 S 3000.00 S ..DO 0.00 6.00 5 3000.00 5 300 
CONe. PAD 4 FT X 4 FT)(6 I"~ 16 EA 6 5 900.00 5 5400.00 12 9.00 S 900.00 S 2700.00 8.OD 0.00 9 .00 5 8100.00 S SID 
TOPSOIL STOCKPILED MATERIAL 17 CY I 50 5 9 .00 5 11 250.00 S 1.25O.DO 0 .00 1 250.00 S 11 250.00 5 1125­
FLEX BASE (NEW) TxDOT (TY 0 GR 6 CL" CALICHE) 
(6 IN.) 18 CY 3865 S 30.00 S 115950.00 2028 4 196.00 S 30.00 S 9930.00 4tJ1;DD 0.00 4 196.00 S 125880.00 S 12588 
HYDRO MULCH 19 SY 31000 S 0.60 S 18600.00 2028 32734.00 S 0.60 S 1040.40 3I,Q34-00 1 700.00 32734.00 S 18620.40 S 1964J 
BOLLARD CUT TO PLAN ])JMENSIONS 20 EA 4530 S 15.00 S 67950.00 1 0.00 S 15.00 S L67950.00 0.00 0.00 0 .00 S S 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA « 
INSTALL PER PLANS)(6 FT.) 21 EA 4203 S 78.00 S 327834.00 2 0.00 S 78.00 S 1327 834.00 0 .00 0.00 0.00 S S 
BOLLARD (TRANSPORT FROM STAGING AREA « 
INSTALL PER PLANS) (20 FT.) 22 EA 327 S 400.00 S 130800.00 1120 106.00 S 400.0000000 S 42400.00 433.00 0.00 433.00 S 173200.00 S 17320 

2831A 196.00 S 150.0000000 S 29400.00 , ...00 0.00 196.00 S 29 400.00 5 29 401 
TOTAlS 121.00 0.00 629.00 S 202600.00 S 20260 

2.10A, 
BOLLARD (SUPPLY. CUT « WELD ANGLE IRON 11,20, 

SUPPORTS) (411'1,)( 4 IN .X 1/411'1. 8 FT.) 23 LF 4.953 S 12.00 S 59436.00 2831A 1261.50 S 12.00 S 144 298.00 121UG 0.00 1 261 .50 S 15138.00 S IS 13 

BOLLARD (SUPPLY & WELD )(In in.X 4 in STEEL 2.28. 
BAR) 24 LF 4621 S 6 .00 S 27726.00 31A 197.00 5 6.00 5 126544.00 11700 0,00 197.00 S 1 182.00 S 118 

1,28, 
BOLLARD (INSTALL « WELD CAPS) 25 EA 4530 5 12.00 S 54 360.00 31A 197.00 S 12.00 S (51996.00 197.00 0.00 197.00 S 2364.00 S 236­

REMOVE EXISTING GATE WELL STRUCTURES A.'1D 
SALVAGE SLUICE GATE ASEMBLIES 26 EA 3 S 3500.00 S 10500.00 S 3.00 0,00 3.00 S 10500.00 5 105'01 

REMOVEPIPE(i2IN (RCP 27 LF 45 S 30.00 5 1 350.00 S 4UO O,DD 45.00 S 1 350.00 S 135 

REMOVE PIPE (18 IN) (RCP) 28 LF 202 S 36.00 S 7272.00 S moo 0.00 202.00 S 7272.00 S 727 

REMOVE PIPE (2411'1) (RCP) 29 LF 105 S 40.00 S 4200.00 S 105.011 0 .00 105.00 S 4200.00 S 4201 

REMOVE PIPE 24 I Nj(STAND PIPE 30 EA I S , 000.00 S 1 000.00 S _tOO O.n. 1.00 5 1 000.00 S 1 001 

REMOVE CONe. COLLAR 611'1 31 EA 4 5 700.00 $ 2800.00 S 4.00 0..00 4.00 S 2800.00 S 2801 

REMOVE CONe. IlEADWALL 32 EA , S 1,000.00 S 1,000.00 S t ,OO 0.00 1.00 S 1,000.00 S 1,001 

RCP (18 IN. (CL VI 33 LF 260 5 69.00 5 17 940.00 $ 260.00 0.00 260.00 S 17940.00 $ 17941 

RCP 24 IN.) CL V 34 LF 83 S 90.00 S 7470.00 S 83.00 0 .00 83.00 S 7470.00 S 7471 

18 AND 24 IN CONCRETE COLLAR 35 EA 3 S 700.00 S 2100.00 S 3.00 0.00 3.00 S 2 100.00 S 2101 

CONe. HEADWALL 181N. (CAST IN PLACE 36 EA 2 S 3500.00 S 7000.00 S 2.00 o.DO 2.00 S 7000.00 S 7001 

CONe. HEADWALL (24 IN . CAST IN PLACE) 37 EA I S 4000.00 S 4000.00 S ' .00 O.OD 1.00 5 4000.00 5 4001 

RE~10VE I SALVAGE (EXIST SLUICE GATE VALVE) 38 EA 2 S 1 500.00 5 3000.00 5 LOO O.DO 2.00 S 3000.00 S 3001 

FLAP GATES W/ WALL PIPE& TEE (61:-1. 0 .1.) 39 EA 6 S 2000.00 S 12000.00 12 9 .00 S 2000.00 S 6000.00 • • 00 o.OD 9.00 S 18000.00 S 18001 

REMOVE EXIST SIGN FENCE MOUNTED FISH « WILD 
LIFE . 40 EA J S 300.00 S 900.00 5 3.00 0 ,00 3.00 S 900.00 S 901 

TRENCH EXCAV. PROTECTION (RET. WALL KEY) 41 LF 4700 S 1.00 S 4700.00 S 4.100.00 0 .00 4700.00 S 4700.00 S 4701 

TRENCH EXCAV. PROTECTION (STRUCTURES) 42 LF 343 S 1.00 S 343.00 5 34: .00 0.00 343.00 S 343.00 S 34: 

TEMPORARY SPECIAL SHORING 43 SF 80.400 S 0 .25 S 20.100.00 S 80.400.00 -
0.00_ _ 80,400.0.0 S 20,100.00 S 20.1Q.1 



DEWATERING 44 LS I $ 24000.00 I $ 24000.00 S f ,OO 0,00' 1.00 $ 24000.00 $ 2401 
NEW SLUICE GATE (24 IN.) 45 EA I $ 5000.00 $ 5000.00 $ 1.00 0.00 1.00 $ 5000.00 $ 501 
INSTALL LEVEE ACCESS GATE NEW) 46 EA I $ 4000.00 S 4000.00 16 0.00 $ 4000.00 $ 4000.00 0.00 11".00 0.00 $ $ 
REMOVE EXISTING LEVEE ACCESS GATE 47 EA I. $ 700.00 $ 700.00 $ 1,00 0.00 1.00 $ 700.00 $ 71 
NEW GATE WELL NO. 233, (RISER.iNSTALL SEW 
SLUICE GATE, LADDER.HATCH,ETC) 48 LS I $ 50000.00 $ 50000.00 $ 1.00 0.00 1.00 $ SO 000.00 S 5001 
NEW GATE WELL NO. 234,IRISER. IlIiSTALL SLUICE 
GATE. LADDER. HATCH. ETC. 49 LS I S SO 000.00 S 50000.00 S 1.00 0.00 1.00 $ 50000.00 S 5001 
NEW GATE WELL NO. 2J~. (RJSER. INSTALL SLUICE 
GATE. LADDER. H,HCH ETC.) 50 LS I $ 60 000.00 $ 60 000.00 S 1.00 0.00 1.00 S 60 000.00 $ 800( 
SHEET WALL DRAlN MATERIAL 51 SF 0 $ S 4 65043.00 $ 3.19999584890 S 208137.33 15.00.00 0.00 65043.00 S 208137.33 S 2081, 
AI.-n-CLIMBING FENCE PANEL 52 EA 0 $ S 9A,28 3.00 S 10000.00 $ 30000.00 2.00 1.00 3.00 S 20000.00 S 30 Ot 
RECONNECTION OF IRRIGATION LINE AT 
STRUCTURE 294 53 LS 0 $ $ 14 1.00 $ 6173.71 $ 6173.71 1,00 0.00 1.00 $ 6173.71 S 611 
STONE RIP RAf(l2" THICK Y R) DRY) 54 CY 0 S S 18 221.00 S 85.09 S 18804.89 221.110 0.00 221.00 S 18804.89 S 188G 
ANTI-CLIMBING FESCE PANEL (REMOVE AND 
REINSTALL) 55 EA 0 S $ 19 8.00 S 2292.84 $ 18342.72 a.oo 0.00 8.00 $ 18342.72 S 1834 
WELD AN ADDITIONAL 6' BOLLARD (TRANSPORT & 
WELD) 56 EA 0 S $ 20 50.00 $ nU8 $ 38564.00 SO.OO 0.00 SO.OO $ 38564.00 S 38se 
WELD AN ADDITIONAL II' BOLLARD (TRANSPORT & 
WELD) 57 EA 0 $ $ 21 17.00 $ 848.00 S 14416.00 17.00 0.00 17.00 $ 14416.00 S 1441 
WELD AN ADDITIONAL II' BOLLARD (TRANSPORT & 
WELD) EA 0 $ $ 21 149.00 S $ 1.UO P.oP 149.00 $ S 
IlIiSTALL ANTI·CLlMB FENCE (OWNER SUPPLIED 58 EA 0 S S 2126 4.00 S 3031.00 $ 12124.00 ..00 0,00 4.00 S 12 124.00 S 1212 
FABRJCATE & INSTALL FLAT SURFACE ANTIO-CLIMB 22,24, 
FENCE 59 EA 0 $ S 29 6.00 S 7918.76 S 47512.56 11.00 0.00 6.00 S 47512.56 $ 4751 
REMOVE & SALVAGE STANDARD ANTI·CLI MB 
FENCE 60 EA 0 S S 2224 4.00 $ 2 110.63 $ 8442.52 4.00 D.oo 4.00 $ 8442.52 $ 844 
MODIFY GATE OPENING FROM A 40 IT TO 20 IT 
OPENING 61 LS 0 $ S 23 1.00 $ 40 437.10 S 40437.10 t.D0 0.00 1.00 S 40437.10 S 40 43 
ADJUSTMENTS TO BOLLARDS WITH DEFICIENT 
SPAC.ING 62 LS 0 S $ 23 1.00 S 4562.90 $ 4562.90 1.00 0.00 1.00 $ 4562.90 S 456 

25,28, 
TERMINAL ANCHOR SECTION 63 EA 0 S $ 31A 6.00 S 500.00 S 3000.00 t .OO 5.00 6.00 S 500.00 S 300 
SHOREBLOCK BD SERIES (B0-400 OPEN CELL) 
(CANAL CHANNEL) 66 SY 0 S S 28 940.00 S 51.00 $ 47940.00 940.00 0,00 940.00 S 47940.00 S 4794 
CONCRETE ABUTME11fr (BRJDGE 67 CY 0 $ S 28 48.00 S 500.00 S 24000.00 41.00 0.00 48.00 S 24000.00 S 2400 
CONCRETE WINGWALL (BRJDGE 68 CY 0 $ $ 28 8.00 S 500.00 $ 4000.00 ._11,00 0.00 8.00 $ 4000.00 S (01) 
C 221 RAILING (BRJDGE) 69 LF 0 S S 28 160.00 $ 80.00 S 12800.00 180./10 0.00 160.00 S 12800.00 S 12.80' 
4S' DRILLED SHAFT (2'-6" DlAJ (BRJDGE) 70 EA 0 S S 28 14.00 S 4000.00 S 56000.00 '~.OO 'o.._I!Il_ 14.00 S 56000.00 S 56 00 
MODIFIED F-SHAPE CONCRETE MEDIAN W/ 
BOLLARDS (BRJDGE) 71 LF 0 S S 28 80.00 S 250.00 S 20000.00 80.00 0.00 80.00 S 20000.00 S 2000' 
PRESTRESSED CONCRETE BOX BEAM (5B28) (19'-6" 
LGlIBRIDGE) 72 EA 0 S S 28 12.00 S 16000.00 S 192000.00 12.00 0.110 12.00 S 192000.00 S 19200 
1" CAST·IN·PLACE BRIDGE DECK (BRIDGE) 73 CY 0 S S 28 150.00 S 300.00 S 45000.00 150,00 UO 150.00 S 45000.00 S 4500' 
BOLLARD FOUNDATION (CONC) 74 CY 0 S S 2831A 84.00 S 450.00 S 37800.00 14.00 0.00 84.00 S 37800.00 S 3780' 
DEWATERJNG CANAL) 75 LS 0 S S 2831A 0.00 S 10000.00 S 0.00 000 0.00 S S 
ELASTOMERIC PADS (TXDOT 10, TY B2g.",~") 
BRJDGE). 76 EA 0 $ S 28 48.00 $ 5.00 S 240.00 48.00 0.00 48.00 S 240.00 S 24 

MOBILIZATION 77 LS 0 S S 28 1.00 S 50000.00 S 50000.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 S 50000.00 S 5000 
REMOBILIZA TlON 78 LS 0 S S 28 1.00 S 36000.00 S 36000.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 S 36000.00 S 3600 
ONE DlRECflON",L ARR"oW SIGN (WI·9L 79 EA 0 S S 28 1.00 S 115.00 S 115.00 1.00 0.00 1.00 S 115.00 S 11 
ONE DIRECTIONAL ARROW SIGN (WI·9R) 80 EA 0 S S 28 1.00 S 115.00 S 115.00 1,00 0.00 1.00 S 115.00 S 11 
WILDLIFE REFUGE SIGN 81 EA 0 S S 28 3.00 S 575.00 S 1 725.00 3.00 0;00 3.00 S I 725.00 S 172 
CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL 82 CY 0 S S 28 133.00 S 60.00 S 7980.00 1;13.00 0.00 133.00 S 7980.00 S 798 
PREP R.O.W. 83 LS 0 S S 28 1.00 S 900.00 S 900.00 1.110 0.00 0.00 S 900.00 $ 90 
AUTODIALER. ALARM SYSTDI 84 EA 0 S S 28 1.00 S 14000.00 S 14000.00 iI.oo 1.00 1.00 S S 1400' 
2112" DIA PIPE RAIL TERMINAL 85 LF 0 S S 28 199.00 S 40.00 S 7960.00 191.00 0'.110 199.00 $ 7,960.00 S 796 
SECURITY GRATE & FRAME IRRJGATION CANAL) 86 LS 0 S S 2831A 1.00 S 65969.08 S 65969.08 a.GO 1,00 1.00 S S 6596' 
CONCRETE HEADERS (2 87 CY 0 S S 28 11 .00 S 400.00 S 4400.00 11.00 0.00 11.00 S 4400.00 S 440' 
SAFETY TRENCH PROTECTION 88 LF 0 S S 28 250.00 S 1.00 S 2SO.00 250.00 0:00 250.00 $ 250.00 S 25 
MBGF 10' RADIUS 89 EA 0 S S 28 4.00 S 250.00 S 1 000.00 4.00 0.00 4.00 $ 1 000.00 S 1 00 
SECURJTY GRATE FOOTING (ALl' #1) (12' DRJLLED 
SHAFT1I2'.o" DiAl 90 EA 0 S S 2831A 0.00 S 1100.00 $ 0,00 0.00 0.00 S S 
STEEL CASING (6" DlA)(2" GAS LINE PENETRATION 
OF WALL) 91 LS 0 $ S 2831A 0.00 S 800.00 S 0.00 O.oa 0.00 s S 
STONE RJP RAP(T\' R; DRY)II8" THICK)(RJVERSIOE 
LEVEE SLOPE PROTECTION) 92 CY 0 $ S 2831A 117.00 S 120.00 S 14,040.00 117,00 0.00 117.00 S 14040.00 S ~ 
WELD (AN ADDITIONAL 10' BOLLARDS (TRANSPORT 
& WELD)) 93 CEA 0 S S 31A 88.00 $ 55.00 S 4840.00 88.00 0.00 88.00 S 4840.00 S 484 

INSTALLATION OFSECURJTY GRATE WITH STEEL 
PILING FOUNDATION 94 LS 0 S S 31A 1.00 S 79,167.57 S 79,167.57 1.00 0.00 1.00 S 79 167.57 S 7916 

M :\ 1540\4410-o2 OHS Seg O...()7\ Pay Requ@$ts\Payment Request No. 24\Payment Request No. 24 - Segment 0-7 ...()6"'()8-12 - blowup 2 of 3 



95 LF 31A 12.50 300.00 0.00 lUG 12.50MHCR!it RADllJS 
~Utt:RIALS OI'\ .HAND 

TOTAL COMF 
TO-DATI 

" ORIGINAL CONTRACT AMOUNT: 11,980,892.00 

NET CHANGES BY CHANGE ORDER(S) 
TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE $ 11,833,293.45 11,929,­

Estimated % Project Completion to Date: 100.00% LESS RETAINAGE@ 10% 1,182,( 
RELEASED RETAINAGE PR #10 S1S,I 
RELEASED RETAINAGE PR #16 287,: 

RELEASE OF REMAINING RETAINAGE TO DATE 3&9,: 
LESS Prev;ous Requests for Payments S 11.450,i 

DEFECTIVE WORK CO NO. 27 $ (2,! 
DEFECTIVE WORK CO NO. 32 $ (!c:: iOrA.i..AMOUNTOUe-THiSREQUEST ($ -~ 

M:\1540\4410·02 DHS Sel 0-07\Pay Requesu\Payment Request No. 24\ Payment Request No. 24 - Segment 0-7 -06-08-12 - blowup 3 of 3 
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DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted By: Jaime Salazar, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

A.) Requesting approval to accept bids and approval of Requirement Agreement(s) for Bid No.

12-009-06-13 "PIPES" to multiple vendors as follows:

1) ACT Pipe & Supply

2) Ferguson Waterworks

3) Contech Engineered Solutions

4) EMMSA Co. 

B.) Requesting approval to advertise for RFB No. 12-014-07-25 "Stone Rip Rap Material". 

C.) Presentation of scoring grid of the firms evaluated through the District's "Pool" of Title Report

Services for the purpose of ranking by the Hidalgo County Drainage District No.1 Board of Directors in

connection with the Title Report Services for Pharr-McAllen South Lateral. 

 

FIRM NAME SCORE RANK

SOUTH TEXAS LAND INVESTIGATIONS 100  

VALLEY LAND & TITLE 94  

D.) Pursuant to the Boards approval, requesting authority to issue Purchase Order to the number one

ranked firm of ___________________________ for Title Report Services for Pharr-McAllen South

Lateral.

BACKGROUND

Attachments

Pipes Bid Tab

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/21/2012 08:11 AM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Jaime Salazar Started On: 06/20/2012 04:42 PM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 



Hidalgo County Drainage District No. 1
Bid No. 12-009-06-13

BID TABULATION

ACT PIPE & 
SUPPLY 

MORRISON 
SUPPLY CO. 

FERGUSON 
WATERWORKS 

CONTECH 
PRODUCTS 

HD WATERWORKS EMMSA CO. 

8' x 12" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE BID NO BID 
8'x 15" SUBMITTED 
8' x 18"
8' x 24"
8' x 30"
8' x 36"
8' x 42"
8' x 48"
8' x 54"
8' x 60"
8' x 66"
8' x 72"

VendorsRUBBER 
GASKET 

PIPE 



   

AI-32915       9.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted For: Godfrey Garza Jr. Submitted By: Lora Briones, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

A. Request approval of Advance Funding Agreement (AFA)  for US 281, from FM 162 to FM 490; CSJ

#0255-07-128.  This AFA is between Hidalgo County Drainage District #1 and Texas Department of

Transportation and requires the District contribute 1.5 million toward the construction of the bridge on

US 281 to address the County's proposed drainage ditch system.

B. Request approval of Budget amendment from the District's General Funds un-reserve  Fund Balance

to fund the above mention Agreement.

C. Request approval to process manual Check to Texas Department of Transportation agreement CSJ

#0255-07-128.

BACKGROUND

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/21/2012 04:37 PM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Lora Briones Started On: 06/20/2012 10:57 AM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 



   

AI-32948       10.             

DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Meeting Date: 06/26/2012  

Submitted For: Godfrey Garza Jr. Submitted By: Lora Briones, DRAINAGE

DISTRICT

Department: DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Information

CAPTION

A.  Request approval to rescind prior action from the District's April 10, 2012 agenda, Item 9A.

(Inter-local agreement between County and Drainage).

B.  Request approval of an Inter-local Cooperation Agreement between Hidalgo County Drainage District

#1 and The County of Hidalgo for the sale and purchase terms of tract #1 and #3 of land  totaling 8.76

acres out of lot (15) fifteen , section 245 of the Texas-Mexican Railway survey of land.

C.  Request approval of the issuance of a manual check to complete the transaction of acquiring land. 

Subject to approval on County Agenda.

BACKGROUND

Attachments

revised interlocal

Form Review

Inbox Reviewed By Date

Budget & Management Merlen P. Munoz 06/21/2012 04:47 PM

Final Approval Monica Badillo 06/22/2012 11:16 AM

Form Started By: Lora Briones Started On: 06/21/2012 03:26 PM

Final Approval Date: 06/22/2012 
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